
KANSAS CITY WOODTURNERS ASSOCIATION 
RELEASE AND WAIVER OF LIABILITY

The Kansas City Woodturners Association (“KCWT”) is a Kansas not-for-profit corporation and 
501(c)(3) charitable organization located at 3189 Mercier St., Kansas City, MO 64111 (the “Premises”). 

I am a member of KCWT, or have been given permission by KCWT to use KCWT’s equipment, tools 
and/or supplies, or am participating in a KCWT class, event or activity. In consideration of my 
membership in KCWT, my use of KCWT’s equipment, tools or supplies, and/or my participation in a 
KCWT class, event or activity, I hereby agree as follows: 

I understand that woodturning can be a dangerous activity. I further understand that woodturning, and 
the equipment, tools and supplies used in woodturning, including, without limitation, woodturning tools, 
lathes, bandsaws, chainsaws, drill presses, power sanders and other power equipment, can cause serious 
injury, temporary or permanent disability, death and/or property damage to persons engaged in 
woodturning activities and persons located nearby. I agree that when I use KCWT’s equipment, tools 
and supplies, I am solely responsible for the proper and safe use of such equipment, tools and supplies 
and for my own safety. I understand that KCWT does not provide supervision of the persons using 
KCWT’s equipment, tools and supplies. I understand that KCWT does not provide medical services and 
that any injury I may sustain may be compounded by negligent or delayed medical service or assistance. 
I VOLUNTARILY AND FREELY ASSUME ALL RISKS AND DANGERS THAT MAY OCCUR 
WHEN I AM ON THE PREMISES, WHEN I AM USING KCWT’S EQUIPMENT, TOOLS AND 
SUPPLIES, OR WHEN I AM PARTICIPATING IN ANY KCWT CLASS, EVENT OR ACTIVITY, 
INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, THE RISK OF INJURY, DISABILITY, DEATH AND 
PROPERTY DAMAGE, EVEN IF CAUSED BY NEGLIGENCE OF KCWT OR ITS DIRECTORS, 
OFFICERS, MEMBERS, DEMONSTRATORS, EMPLOYEES, VOLUNTEERS OR AGENTS. 

I hereby agree, on behalf of myself, my heirs and my personal representatives, to fully and forever 
discharge and release KCWT and its directors, officers, members, demonstrators, employees, volunteers 
and agents (“Released Parties”) from any and all claims I, my heirs or my personal representatives may 
hereinafter have for any injury, temporary or permanent disability, death, damages, liabilities, expenses 
and/or causes of action, now known or hereinafter known in any jurisdiction, attributable or relating in 
any manner to my entry upon and use of the Premises, my use of KCWT’S equipment, tools or supplies, 
or my participation in any KCWT class, event or activity, whether caused by the negligence of the 
Released Parties or by any other reason. I acknowledge and agree that this Release and Waiver of 
Liability is intended to be, and is, a complete release, as much as allowed by law, of any responsibility 
or liability of the Released Parties for all personal injuries, temporary or permanent disability, death, 
and/or property damage sustained by me while on the Premises, using KCWT’S equipment, tools or 
supplies, or participating in any KCWT class, event or activity. 

Signature:  ______________________________________  Date:  _________________ 

Printed Name: ___________________________________ 

Emergency Contact(s):  

_________________________  _____________   _________________________  _____________ 
Name      Phone                   Name             Phone 


